Resolution No. 2023-173 March 21, 2023

RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO SIMAK, KINDER MORGAN, CAPP STEEL AND HOLCIM FOR
AGGREGATE AND SUIT-KOTE FOR LIQUID ASPHALT EMULSION CRS-2 AND CMS-2, ENGINEER’S OFFICE
WHEREAS, On February 28, 2023, by Resolution No. 2023-128 bids were ordered for Aggregate and Asphalt
Emulsion, and
WHEREAS, on March 16 at 10:00 (Stone) & 10:30 a.m. (Emulsion), the County Engineer, on behalf of the Board
of Commissioners, received bids, as follows:

AGGREGATE: #308
LOT NO. 1, 2, 3 and 4:

BIDDER LOT #1 #67 | LOT #2 #8 | LOT#3 #411 | LOT #4 #304
Aggregate Aggregate Aggregate Aggregate
9,200 tons 3,200 tons 2,200 tons 3,500 tons
Kinder Morgan Unit No bid $ 2390 | $ 1899 | $ 18.99
Total No bid $ 76,480.00 | $ 41,778.00 | $ 66,465.00
Holcim Unit No Bid No Bid $ 1785 | $ 17.85
Total No Bid No Bid $ 39,270.00 | $ 62,475.00
Simak Unit $ 27.55 | no bid no bid no bid
Total $ 253,460.00
Capp Steel Unit $ 29.76 | no bid no bid no bid
Total $ 273,792.00 no bid no bid no bid

Engineer’s estimate: $421,400.00

WHEREAS, it is recommended to award Lot #1 to Simak for aggregate in the amount of $253,460.00, Lot #2 to
Kinder Morgan for $76,480.00, to Holcim for Lot #3 for $39,270.00 and Lot #4 for $62,475.00

LIQUID ASPHALT EMULSION: #309

BIDDER CRS-2 FOB | CRS-2 FOB | CMS-2 FOB | GRAND
Jefferson Job Site | Jefferson TOTAL:
103,500 103,500 202,500
Russell Standard Corp. Price/Gal | $ 2.35 $ 235| $ 2.80
Total $  243,225.00 | $ 243,225.00 | $§ 464,800.00 | 708,025.00
Actual $ 216,200.00 | $ 216,200.00 681,000.00
Suit-Kote Corp. Price/Gal | $ 2285 | $ 2285 | $ 2.645
Total $ 210,220.00 | $ 210,220.00 | $ 439,070.00 | 649,290.00

Engineer’s Estimate: 612,060.00



Resolution No. 2023-173 March 21, 2023

WHEREAS, it is recommended to award #309 CRS-2 and CMS-2 to Suit-Kote Corp for the amount of $ 649,290.00;
and
THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, By the Board of Commissioners of Ashtabula County, Ohio, that the bids

are hereby received and awarded as outlined above.



ASHTABULA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

CERTIFICATION PAGE

Resolution No. 2023-173 March 21, 2023

RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO SIMAK, KINDER MORGAN,
CAPP STEEL AND HOLCIM FOR AGGREGATE AND SUIT-KOTE FOR LIQUID
ASPHALT EMULSION CRS-2 AND CMS-2, ENGINEER'S OFFICE

Upon the motion of Kathryn L. Whittington, seconded by J.P. Ducro IV.

VOTE:

Casey R. Kozlowski Aye
Kathryn L. Whittington Aye
J.P.Ducro IV Aye

CERTIFICATE OF CLERK

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing is a true and correct transcript of a
resolution acted upon and duly passed by the Board of County Commissioners of
Ashtabuta County, Ohio, on the date noted above.

Joo_forkine-

Lisa Hawkins, Clerk of the Board
Board of County Commissioners
Ashtabula County, Ohio
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