
RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO ROBINSON TRUCKING AND KINDER MORGAN AND 
SUIT-KOTE FOR CRS-2 AND CMS-2, ENGINEER’S OFFICE 

WHEREAS, On February 27, 2024, by Resolution No. 2024-123 bids were ordered for Aggregate and Asphalt 

Emulsion, and

WHEREAS, on March 21, 2024 at 10:00 (Stone) & 10:30 a.m. (Emulsion), the County Engineer, on behalf of the 

Board of Commissioners, received bids, as follows:

AGGREGATE: #315
LOT NO. 1, 2, 3 and 4:

BIDDER  LOT #1  #67 
Aggregate  
9,200 tons 

 LOT #2  #8 
Aggregate  
3,200 tons 

 LOT#3 #411 
Aggregate  
2,000 tons 

 LOT #4 #304 
Aggregate  
3,00 tons 

Kinder Morgan Unit  No bid   $              25.42  $           20.50  $             20.50 

Total  No bid   $     81,344.00  $   41,000.00  $       6150.00 

Holcim/LaFarge Unit  No Bid No Bid $           21.50  $            21.50

Total  No Bid No Bid  $   42,000.00 $         6300.00

Simak Unit  $            29.98  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Total $ 275,816.00

Robinson Trucking Unit  $            29.37  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Total $ 270,204.00  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Engineer’s estimate:  $404,200.00

WHEREAS, it is recommended to award Lot #1 to Robinson Trucking for aggregate in the amount of 

$270,204.00 Lot #2, to Kinder Morgan for $ 81,344.00, #2 to Kinder Morgan for 41,000.00 and Lot #3 to Kinder Morgan 

for $6150.00; and

LIQUID ASPHALT EMULSION: #316
BIDDER CRS-2    FOB 

Jefferson   

92,000.00    

CRS-2  FOB 

Job Site 

92,000.00 

CMS-2  FOB 

Jefferson 

166,000.00 

GRAND 
TOTAL: 

Russell Standard Corp. Price/Gal $             2.3525  $            2.3525  $                    2.775

Total  $        213,900.00 $  213,900.00  $       460,650.00 674,550.00

Suit-Kote Corp. Price/Gal $                     2.22  $              2.22  $                    2.73

Total  $       204,240.00 $  204,240.00  $       453,180.00 657,420.00

Engineer’s Estimate:  711,400.00 

Resolution No. 2024-168 March 26, 2024



WHEREAS, it is recommended to award #316 CRS-2 and CMS-2 to Suit-Kote Corp for the amount of $ 

657,420.00; now

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, By the Board of Commissioners of Ashtabula County, Ohio, that the bids are 

hereby received and awarded as outlined above.

Resolution No. 2024-168 March 26, 2024








