Resolution No. 2024-185 April 02, 2024

RESOLUTION AWARDING QUOTATIONS AND AUTHORIZING THE DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING AND
DEVELOPMENT TO ENTER INTO AN AGREEMENT WITH KAPALIN INC FOR HOUSEHOLD SEWAGE
TREATMENT SYSTEM (HSTS), WATER POLLUTION CONTROL LOAN FUND (WPCLF)

WHEREAS, On March 29, 2024 quotes were received to install a septic system for the HSTS program under

the Department of Planning and Development, as follows:

Date
Contractor solicited Method Date Received Quotation Received
Boczar Excavating 3/19/2024 Pick Up 3/29/2024 $19,497
Daughters Excavating Co.
LLC 3/19/2024 Pick Up 3/29/2024 $14,925.00
Kapalin Inc. 3/19/2024 Email 3/29/2024 $14,775.00
JC Hauling & Excavating 3/19/2024 Email No Bid No Bid

WHEREAS, Jake Brand, Director of the Dept. of Planning and Development has recommended to award the
quote and requests permission to enter into agreements (after receiving OEPA approval) with Kapalin Inc., Jefferson

OH, as follows:

Total Homeowner HSTS
HSTS Applicant Contract Share Share
Amber Johnson- 1895 Griggs Rd. Jefferson $14,775.00 $0.00 | $14,775.00

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, By the Board of Commissioners of Ashtabula County, Ohio, that quotes are
awarded to Kapalin Inc. and the Department of Planning and Development is authorized to enter into agreements in
accordance with the copies now on file.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, Jake Brand, as Director of the Planning and Development Department is
authorized to sign all documents related to these agreements.
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Upon the motion of Casey R. Kozlowski, seconded by J.P. Ducro IV,

VOTE:

Kathryn L. Whittington Aye
J.P. Ducro IV Aye
Casey R. Kozlowski Aye

CERTIFICATE OF CLERK

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing is a true and correct transcript of a
resolution acted upon and duly passed by the Board of County Commissioners of
Ashtabula County, Ohio, on the date noted above.

Lisa Hawkins, Clerk of the Board
Board of County Commissioners
Ashtabuta County, Ohio




Name: Johnson Properties Quoted On: 1895 Griggs Rd, Jefferson OH 44047

Request for quotes sent: 3/19/2024 Quote Open Date: 3/29/2024

Maximum Quote $50,000.00

Boczar Excavating LLC
Johnson- 1895 Griggs Rd. S 19,497.00
Total S 19,497.00

Dana Daughters Excavating Co. LLC.

Johnson- 1895 Griggs Rd. S 14,925.00

Total S 14,925.00
Kapalin

Johnson- 1895 Griggs Rd. S 14,775.00

Total S 14,775.00

JC Hauling & Excavating

Johnson-1895 Griggs Rd. NO Bid
Total S -
Apparent Lowest Bidder: Kapalin Inc. Amount of quote: $14,775.00

Comments:







2023 HSTS Solicitation
Ashtabula County Planning and Development

Contractor Date solicited |Method |Date Received |Quotation Received

Boczar Excavating 3/19/2024(Pick Up 3/29/2024 $19,497
Daughters Excavating Co. LLC 3/19/2024(Pick Up 3/29/2024 $14,925.00
Kapalin Inc. 3/19/2024|Email 3/29/2024 $14,775.00
JC Hauling & Excavating 3/19/2024|Email No Bid No Bid

Amber Johnson-
1895 Griggs Rd, Jefferson OH 44047

O:\HSTS (Home Septic Treatment System)\2023\Applications\Johnson, Amber 1895 Griggs Rd\2. Bid Docs\Solicitations for 2023 Johnson HSTS



Ashtabula

COUNTY, OHIO

Request for Quote-Septic System Installer

Ashtabula County has received an OEPA HSTS WPCLF award to assist income qualified homeowners
with replacement of failing septic systems. Ashtabula County Department of Planning and
Development has qualified applicants and secured professionals to evaluate the soils and design
appropriate systems for each appficant. Ashtabula County will be paying for services for the qualifying
home-owners.

Ashtabula County is seeking qualified septic system installers to install replacement systems for the
following applicants using the system provided in the plans and specifications.

s Amber Johnson- 1895 Griggs Rd. Jefferson OH 44047

Scope of Work: Using the Plans & Specifications provided obtain permit from Ashtabula County Health
Department and install the replacement system as designed.

Per the terms of the HSTS WPCLF program, Ashtabuta County will enter into a contract with the selected
septic system installer who will need to provide all appropriate information in the attached contract.

Time Period: All work must be complete by 5/31/2024.

Quote Information
Quotes must be received by Friday, March 29 at 4:00 PM.
Please send the quote information via email to: snjammal@ashtabulacounty.us or fax to 440-576-2758.
Quotes can also be dropped off to the Office of Planning and Development, 25 West Jefferson St.

Company: ]’Z\Q(‘OCL\'\ AN YA

Name:_Busse il Kapalin

Signature:_ teradt 7 ittt

Address:_ 305  S4. RE. 1]

city_ 3¢ £ Lersom State:_ OH Zip code: {HOU ]
Phone: U0~ AL A - 23 87

Email:__¥opalinine cjja&mau\ LU

Provide the approximate number of septic system installations in Ashtabula County conducted in last 2

years___ 444




HSTS

Amber Johnson
1895 Griggs Road
Jefferson, OH 44047
44(-858-5375

ITEM QTY | UNIT COST
Mobilization/Demobilization 1 LS 500, 0o
Demolish & Dispose Existing Tank 1 LS £00.00
J-Jet 500 Aeration Tank w/ UV Light 1 EA 5066 .60
4" PVC SCH 40 Pipe 50 LF 560 .00
4" PVC SCH 40 Fittings 6 EA 10¢ .00
1.5" PVC SCH 40 Pipe 96 LF 106,00
1.6" PVC SCH 40 Fittings 10 EA 5000
4" Cleanout (LS) 1 EA 76, 50
Effluent Pump 1 EA 550 00
Sampling Package 1 LS 10000
Catch Basin 1 EA 5150 .00
LABOR booo. .00
Permits Q06 . 00
TOTAL 4,725.00

QUANTITIES ARE APPROXIMATE

I will begin the work within &~ consecutive calendar days from the date of the Contract
Award Proceed Order and will complete the work in 3¢ days from the date of the proceed
order, unless otherwise agreed by the Owner and approved by the agency.
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