Resolution No. 2025-156 March 25, 2025

RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO SIMAK TRUCKING AND KINDER MORGAN FOR AGGREGATE
AND SUIT-KOTE FOR ASPHALT EMULSION, ENGINEER’S OFFICE

WHEREAS, On February 27, 2025, by Resolution No. 2025-108 bids were ordered for Aggregate and Asphalt
Emulsion, and

WHEREAS, on March 20, 2025 at 10:00a.m. (Stone) & 10:30 a.m. (Emulsion), the County Engineer, on behalf of
the Board of Commissioners, received bids, as follows:
AGGREGATE: #320-LOT NO. 1, 2, 3 and 4:

BIDDER LOT #1 #67 | LOT #2 #8 | LOT#3 #411 | LOT #4 #304
Aggregate Aggregate Aggregate Aggregate
9,200 tons 3,200 tons 2,000 tons 3,00 tons
Kinder Morgan Unit No bid $ 2595 | § 2140 | $ 21.40
Total No bid $ 83,040.00 | $ 10,700.00 | $ 6420.00
Simak Unit $ 29.64 | no bid no bid no bid
Total $272,688.00
Robinson Trucking Unit $ 30.72 | no bid no bid no bid
Total $282,624.00 | no bid no bid no bid

Engineer’s estimate: $399,000.00

WHEREAS, it is recommended and the Board of Commissioners would agree to award Aggregate # 320 to the
following:
Lot #1 to Simak Trucking in the amount of $272,688.00
Lot #2 to Kinder Morgan for $83,040.00
Lot #3 to Kinder Morgan for $10,700.00
Lot #4 to Kinder Morgan for $6,420.00; and

LIQUID ASPHALT EMULSION: #321

BIDDER CRS-2 FOB | CRS-2 FOB | CMS-2 FOB | GRAND
Jefferson Job Site | Jefferson TOTAL:
$92,000.00 $92,000.00 $166,000.00

Russell Standard Corp. Price/Gal | $ 2.33 $ 233 | $ 2.75

Total $ 214,360.00 | $ 214,360.00 $  456,500.00 | $670,860.00
Suit-Kote Corp. Price/Gal | $ 2095 | $ 2095 | $ 2.48

Total $ 192,740.00 | $ 192,740.00 $  411,680.00 | $604,420.00

Engineer’s Estimate: $658,000.00

WHEREAS, it is recommended and the Board of Commissioners would agree to award Liquid Asphalt Emulsion
#321, including CRS-2 and CMS-2 to Suit-Kote Corp for the amount of $604,420.00; and

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, By the Board of Commissioners of Ashtabula County, Ohio, that the bids are

hereby received and awarded as outlined above.



ASHTABULA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

CERTIFICATION PAGE

Resolution No. 2025-156 March 25, 2025

RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO SIMAK TRUCKING AND
KINDER MORGAN FOR AGGREGATE AND SUIT-KOTE FOR ASPHALT
EMULSION, ENGINEER’S OFFICE

Upon the motion of Kathryn L. Whittington, seconded by Casey R. Kozlowski.

VOTE:

J.P. Ducro IV Aye
Casey R. Kozlowski Aye
Kathryn L. Whittington Aye

CERTIFICATE OF CLERK

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing is a true and correct transcript of a
resolution acted upon and duly passed by the Board of County Commissioners of
Ashtabula County, Ohio, on the date noted above.

Lisa Hawkins, Clerk of the Board
Board of County Commissioners
Ashtabula County, Ohio
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BID SHEET FOR AGGREGATES (Limestone only)
Quotation #320

Lot #1 — Delivered via dump truck to Ashtabula County Highway Dept. 186 East
Satin Street Jefferson, Ohio

Unit Price Extension
Lot#1l
9200 tons #67 Aggregate S No Bid S No Bid
Engineer’s Estimate $294,000.00

Lots #2, #3, #4 — Picked up at the point of supply and loaded onto Ashtabula
County Highway Dept. vehicles.

Unit Price Extension
Lot #2
3,200 tons #8 Aggregate $25.95 $ 83,040.00
Engineer’s Estimate S 88,000.00
Lot #3
500 tons #411 Aggregate $21.40 $10,700.00
Engineer’s Estimate $ 11,000.00
Lot #4
300 tons #304 Aggregate $21.40 $ 6,420.00
Engineer’s Estimate S 6,000.00

Ashtabula County reserves the right to award a contract for each lot based on
the lowest and best meeting specifications, or reject any and all bids.

State point of supplier: Kinder Morgan/Pinney Dock & Transport LLC
1149 E. 5' Street — Ashtabula, Ohio 44004

State point of origin: Carmeuse Americas — Port Inland Quarry - Gulliver, Ml.
Carmeuse Americas — Calcite Quarry — Rogers City, Ml.
Carmeuse Americas — Drummond Island Quarry-Drummond Is, MI.

Submitted by: Kinder Morgan/Pinney Dock & Transport LLC
Name of Company

1149 East 5 Street — Ashtabula, Ohio
Address of Company

Brad J. Biro, Terminal Manager

Contact Person: Judy Sims . .
Telephone Number: (440) 969-6813 Office

(440) 645-8731 Cell



BID SHEET FOR AGGREGATES (Limestone only)
Quotation #320

Lot #1 - Delivered via dump truck to Ashtabula County Highway Dept. 186 East
Satin Street Jefferson, Ohio .

Unit Price Extension
Lot #1 ‘ L
9,200 tons #67 Aggregate $730.)L g 23 6JY4.00
Engineer's Estimate $ 294,000.00

Lots #2,#3,#4 - Picked up at the point of supply and loaded onto Ashtabula
County Highway Dept. vehicles.

Unit Price Extension
Lot #2
3,200 tons #8 Aggregate $ $
Engineer's Estimate $ 88,000.00
Lot #3
500 tons #411 Aggregate $ $
Engineer’s Estimate $ 11,000.00
Lot#4
300 tons #304 Aggregate $ $
Engineer's Estimate $ 6,000.00

Ashtabula County reserves the right to award a contract for each lot based on the
lowest and best meeting specifications, or reject any and all bids.

State point of supplier: _Kade' agerod D WY Dock 1119 EsmST ASUTrbAS ol HooH

State point of origin: (YartimevSe STonl Guiliver Michi nosnit (Sl 7 ebugenst
g g [ Dy

Submitted by: _ 7 a4 iei3 iSen TTVCIG i1
Name of Company =

oY Deawsy Z) Theubion OH i
Address of Company

Contact Person: “ 70 J_Robisen
Telephone Number: LJH,0- UE) -Sgy )




BID SHEET FOR AGGREGATES (Limestone only)
Quotation #320

Lot #1 - Delivered via dump truck to Ashtabula County Highway Dept. 186 East
Satin Street Jefferson, Ohio

Unit Price Extension
Lot #1 " , 0
9,200 tons #67 Aggregate $_29. ‘*04 s 217, L33 .°
Engineer's Estimate $ 294,000.00

Lots #2,#3,#4 - Picked up at the point of supply and loaded onto Ashtabula
County Highway Dept. vehicles.

Unit Price Extension
Lot #2
3,200 tons #8 Aggregate » $ $
Engineer's Estimate $ 88,000.00
Lot #3
500 tons #411 Aggregate $ $
Engineer's Estimate $ 11,000.00
Lot #4
300 tons #304 Aggregate $ $
Engineer's Estimate $ 6,000.00

Ashtabula County reserves the right to award a contract for each lot based on the
lowest and best meeting specifications, or reject any and all bids.

State point of supplier: MMJCV MDM&LM .
State point of origin: | |49 F . 6+‘1

AShtabulg, O L0
Submitted by: &mak tVu cliing & [:)(C&\/ﬂ'h Mj ne .

Name of Company

3062 £ Cender St -P.0. Pox 599

Address of Company

N Km%vﬂlc 0H HH0 (LB

Contact Person: M&Vﬁ Pl /Rg d
Telephone Number: UFLILO . rLrL"} . M q L.
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ASHTABULA COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
QUOTATION #321

BID SHEET FOR LIQUID ASPHALT EMULSION

Amount FOB Jefferson FOB Job Site
Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
CRS-2 $2.095 $192,740.0 $2.095 $192,740.0
92,000 gallons
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE : $ 205,000.00 (FOB Jefferson)
FOB Jefferson
Unit Price  Extension
CMS-2 $2.480 $411,680.00 MS2 Emulsion as an alternative
166,000 gallons
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE : $ 453,000.00 (FOB Jefferson)
TOTAL COST (FOB Jefferson) $609.420.00

TOTAL COST (FOB Job Site & Jefferson) $802,160.0

Submitted by : _Suit-Kote Corporation

Name of Company

19065 McHenry Street

Address of Company
Meadyville PA 16335

Contact Person : Joseph J=Goodman Jr, Sales Representative

Telephone Number : 814-657-5423




ASHTABULA COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT
QUOTATION #321

BID SHEET FOR LIQUID ASPHALT EMULSION

Amount FOB Jefferson FOB Job Site
Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
CRS-2 $9-35 g aM,Boee ¢ 933 $ 91, 360, 00
92,000 gallons
ENGINEER’'S ESTIMATE - $ 205,000.00 (FOB Jefferson)
FOB Jefferson
Unit Price Extension
CMS-2 $9.75 g u5b,500.00
166,000 gallons
ENGINEER’S ESTIMATE : $ 453,000.00 (FOB Jefferson)
TOTAL COST (FOB Jefferson) $_H5L,500.00

TOTAL COST (FOB Job Site & Jefferson) $ LT0,%L0.c0

Submitted by : qusse.\\ Clanderd Coq‘?

Name of Company

C\C\Q Heazel Sheeelt

Address of Company
MNscon, 0. Y308

Contact Person : 6\&¢< %K'\%hcx

Telephone Number : 330 - 399~ 3oH




