Resolution No. 2026-124

RESOLUTION RECEIVING BID AND AWARDING TO FORTERRA PIPE AND PRECAST LLC. DBA RINKER

MATERIALS REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE, QUOTATION NO. 325, ENGINEER’S DEPT.

WHEREAS, On February 3, 2026 by Resolution Number 2026-85, bids were ordered for reinforced concrete

pipe, for the Ashtabula County Engineers Department; and

WHEREAS, on February 24, 2026, one bid was received by Forterra Pipe and Precast dba Rinker Materials, as

follows:

QUOTATION NO. 325- BIDDING OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE:

Culvert Projects 2026

Forterra / dba Rinker

March 03, 2026

Northern Concrete Pipe

Quantity & Description FOB Delivered FOB Delivered
Point of Supply Jefferson Ohio Point of Supply Jefferson Ohio

80’ of 54” RCP S/ft. 194.20 S/ft. 231.18 S/ft. 206.14 N
(CH 63 C 1.91) Dawsey Rd.

TOTAL: | $15,536.00 $18,494.40 $16,903.48 o
40’ of 60” RCP S/ft. 199.55 S/ft. 243.75 S/ft. 248.70
(TH 171 A .31) Falkenburg Rd.

TOTAL: | $7982.00 $9,750.00 $10,196.70 B
128’ of 60” dia. RCP S/ft.  199.55 S/ft.  243.75 S/ft. 248.70 |
(CH 112 € 2.6) Forman Rd.

TOTAL: | $25,542.40 $31,200.00 $28,550.76 D

(114.8')

112’ of 60” dia. RCP S/ft.  199.55 S/ft.  243.75 No Bid
(TH 414 D 3.06) Root Rd.

TOTAL: | $22,349.60 $27,300.00 No Bid N
112’ of 60” dia. RCP $/ft. 199.55 S/ft.  243.75 S/ft.  248.70
(TH 160 A .5) California Rd

TOTAL: | $22,349.60 $31,200.00 $28,550.76
64’ of 72” dia. RCP S/ft.  296.88 S/ft.  353.43 S/ft. 357.44 B
(CH 33 11 25.05) Stan.
Kelloggsville Rd

TOTAL: | $19,000.32 $22,619.52 $23,448.06 |
112’ of 96” dia. RCP S/ft.  537.95 S/ft.  602.50 S/ft. 844.40 D
(TH 223 B ) Ninevah Rd.

TOTAL: | $60,250.40 $67,480.00 $94,572.80

Grand Total: | $173,010.32 $204,143.92 $202,226.56

WHEREAS, the Engineer’'s recommends the award of this bid as the lowest and best bid received; and

WHEREAS, this Board concurs with the recommendation and hereby awards the Concrete Pipe bid to Forterra

Pipe and Precast LLC. dba Rinker Materials, as outlined above; now




Resolution No. 2026-124 March 03, 2026

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, By the Board of Commissioners of Ashtabula County, Ohio, that the bid is
hereby received and awarded to Forterra Pipe and Precast LLC. dba Rinker Materials, as outlined above.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED, that this pipe is to be used for the 2026 culvert projects and funding will be from
MVGT.



ASHTABULA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
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Resolution No. 2026-124 March 03, 2026

RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO FORTERRA PIPE AND
PRECAST LLC. DBA RINKER MATERIALS FOR REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE,
QUOTATION NO. 325, ENGINEER’S DEPT.

Upon the motion of J.P. Ducro IV, seconded by Kathryn L. Whittington.

VOTE:

Casey R. Kozlowski Aye
Kathryn L. Whittington Aye
J.P. Ducro IV Aye

CERTIFICATE OF CLERK

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing is a true and correct transcript of a
resolution acted upon and duly passed by the Board of County Commissioners of
Ashtabula County, Ohio, on the date noted above.

Lisa Hawkins, Clerk of the Board

Board of County Commissioners
Ashtabula County, Ohio




Culvert Projects 2026

Bid Tab Quotation # 325

Reinforced Concrete Pipe Culvert

ODOT 706.02; Class lll; ASTM C-76; in 8 lengths

Forterra / dba Rinker

Northern Concrete Pipe

Quantity & Description FOB Delivered FOB Delivered
Point of Supply Jefferson Ohio Point of Supply Jefferson Ohio
80’ of 54" RCP $/ft. 194.20 $/ft. 231.18 $/t. 206.14 N
(CH 63 C 1.91) Dawsey Rd.
TOTAL: | $15,536.00 $18,494.40 $16,903.48 o)
40’ of 60" RCP $/ft. 199.55 $/ft. 243.75 $/ft. 248.70
(TH 171 A .31) Falkenburg Rd.
TOTAL: | $7982.00 $9,750.00 $10,196.70 B
128’ of 60” dia. RCP $/ft.  199.55 $/t.  243.75 $/it. 248.70 |
(CH 112 C 2.6) Forman Rd.
TOTAL: | $25,542.40 $31,200.00 $28,550.76 (114.8’) D
112’ of 60" dia. RCP $/ft.  199.55 $/ft. 243.75 No Bid
(TH 414 D 3.06) Root Rd.

4 TOTAL: | $22,349.60 $27,300.00 No Bid N
112’ of 60" dia. RCP $/ft. 199.55 $/ft.  243.75 $/it. 248.70 0
(TH 160 A .5) California Rd

TOTAL: | $22,349.60 $31,200.00 $28,550.76
64’ of 72" dia. RCP $/ft. 296.88 $/4t. 353.43 $/1t. 357.44 B
(CH 33 11 25.05) Stan. Kelloggsville Rd

TOTAL: | $19,000.32 $22,619.52 $23,448.06 |
112’ of 96” dia. RCP $//t.  537.95 $/t. 602.50 $/it. 844.40 D
(TH 223 B ) Ninevah Rd.

TOTAL: | $60,250.40 $67,480.00 $94,572.80

Grand Total: | $173,010.32 $204,143.92 $202,226.56




