
RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO SOLTIS & SONS, NATIONAL LIME & STONE AND 
KINDER MORGAN FOR LIMESTONE AND SUIT-KOTE FOR CRS-2 AND CMS-2, ENGINEER’S OFFICE 

WHEREAS, On March 3, 2026, by Resolution No. 2026-122, bids were ordered for Aggregate and Asphalt 

Emulsion, and

WHEREAS, on March 20, 2026 at 10:00 (Stone) & 10:30 a.m. (Emulsion), the County Engineer, on behalf of the 

Board of Commissioners, received bids, as follows:

AGGREGATE: #326
LOT NO. 1, 2, 3 and 4:

BIDDER  LOT #1 #67 
Aggregate 
9,200 tons 

 LOT #2 #8 
Aggregate 
3,200 tons 

 LOT#3 
#411 
Aggregate 
1500 tons 

 LOT #4 
#304 
Aggregate 
3000 tons 

Soltis & Sons Unit $30.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Total  $283,360.00  

National Lime & Stone Unit  $ 31.65  $26.20 $22.05 $22.05
Total $ 291,180.00 $83,840.00 $33,075.00 $66,150.00

Kinder Morgan Unit No Bid $26.36 $21.40 $21.40
Unit $84,352.00 $32,100.00 $64,200.00

Simak Unit $30.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total 284,832.00

Robinson Trucking Unit  $ 32.57  no bid  no bid  no bid 
Total $ 299,644.00  

Engineer’s estimate:  $462,900.00

WHEREAS, it is recommended to award Lot #1 to Soltis & Sons for aggregate in the amount of $283,360.00, 

Lot #2 to National Lime & Stone for $ 83,840.00, Lot #3 to Kinder Morgan for $32,100.00 and Lot #4 to Kinder Morgan 

for $64,200.00

LIQUID ASPHALT EMULSION: #327
BIDDER CRS-2    FOB 

Jefferson   

92,000.00    

CRS-2 FOB 

Job Site 

92,000.00 

CMS-2 FOB 

Jefferson 

166,000.00 

GRAND 
TOTAL: 

Suit-Kote Corp. Price/Gal $                     2.29  $              2.29  $                   2.85

Total  $210,680.00 $210,680.00  $473,100.00 $683,780.00

Resolution No. 2026-160 March 24, 2026



Engineer’s Estimate:  603,960.00 

WHEREAS, it is recommended to award #327 CRS-2 and CMS-2 to Suit-Kote Corp for the amount of 

$683,780.00; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners would concur with the recommendations of the County Engineer; now

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, By the Board of Commissioners of Ashtabula County, Ohio, that the 

bids are hereby received and awarded as outlined above.
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