Resolution No. 2022-182

RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO SIMAK, KINDER MORGAN AND LAFARGE FOR

March 29, 2022

AGGREGATE AND RUSSELL STANDARD CORP FOR CRS-2 AND CMS-2, ENGINEER’S OFFICE

WHEREAS, On March 8, 2022, by Resolution No. 2022-139 bids were ordered for Aggregate and Asphalt

Emulsion, and

WHEREAS, on March 24 at 10:00 (Emulsion) & 10:30 a.m. (stone), the County Engineer, on behalf of the Board

of Commissioners, received bids, as follows:

AGGREGATE: #303

LOT NO. 1, 2, 3 and 4:

BIDDER LOT #1 #67 | LOT #2 #8 | LOT#3 #411 | LOT #4 #304
Aggregate Aggregate Aggregate Aggregate
11,250 tons 3600 tons 2,500 tons 2,000 tons
Kinder Morgan Unit No bid $ 2050 | $ 16.91 | $ 16.91
Total No bid $ 73,800.00 | $ 42,275.00 | $ 33,820.00
La Farge Unit No Bid No Bid $ 16.70 | $ 16.50
Total No Bid No Bid $ 41,750.00 | $ 33,000.00
Simak Unit $ 24.99 | no bid no bid no bid
Total $218,137.50 | no bid no bid no bid

Engineer'’s estimate: $429,000.00
WHEREAS, it is recommended to award Lot #1 to Simak for aggregate in the amount of $281,137.50, Lot #2 to

Kinder Morgan for $73,800.00, Lot #3 for $41,750.00 and Lot #4 for $33,000.00 to LaFarge; and

#302 LIQUID ASPHALT EMULSION:

BIDDER CRS-2 FOB | CRS-2 FOB | CMS-2 FOB | GRAND
Jefferson Job Site | Jefferson TOTAL:
103,500 103,500 202,500
Russell Standard Corp. Price/Gal | $ 216.00 $ 216 | $ 2.49
Total $ 223,560.00 | $ 223,560.00 | $ 504,225.00 | 727,785.00
Suit-Kote Corp. Price/Gal | $ 2165 | $ 2165 | $ 2.40 | 710,007.50

Engineer’s Estimate: 673,000.00

WHEREAS, it is recommended to award the bids for Aggregate Lot #1 in the amount of $281,137.50 to Simak;
award Lot #2 in the amount of $73,800.00 to Kinder Morgan and #3 and #4 to LaFarge for a total of $66,820.00 #302
CRS-2 and CMS-2 and to award the Liquid Asphalt Emulsion bid to Russell Standard Corp for the amount of
$727,785.00, as no Suit-Kote failed to supply a bid guarantee until after the bids were received and opened and therefore

need to be rejected; and



Resolution No. 2022-182 March 29, 2022

WHEREAS, This Board would concur with the recommendations and award the bid for Aggregate to Lot #1 in
the amount of $281,137.50 to Simak, award Lot #2 in the amount of $73,800.00 to Kinder Morgan, and #3 and #4 to
LaFarge for a total of $66,820.00 AND award the bid for #302 for CRS-2 and CMS-2 to Russell Standard Corp. in the
amount of $727,785.00; now

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, By the Board of Commissioners of Ashtabula County, Ohio, that the bids are
hereby received and awarded as outlined above.



ASHTABULA COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
CERTIFICATION PAGE

Resolution No. 2022-182 March 29, 2022

RESOLUTION RECEIVING BIDS AND AWARDING TO SIMAK, KINDER MORGAN
AND LAFARGE FOR AGGREGATE AND RUSSELL STANDARD CORP FOR CRS-2
AND CMS-2, ENGINEER’S OFFICE

Upon the motion of Kathryn L. Whittington, seconded by Casey R. Kozlowski.

VOTE:

J.P. Ducro IV Aye
Casey R. Kozlowski Aye
Kathryn L. Whittington Aye

CERTIFICATE OF CLERK

IT IS HEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing is a true and correct transcript of a
resolution acted upon and duly passed by the Board of County Commissioners of
Ashtabula County, Ohio, on the date noted above.

Lisa Hawkins, Clerk of the Board

Board of County Commissioners
Ashtabula County, Ohio
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ASHTABULA COUNTY ENGINEER’S OFFICE
Timothy T. Martin P.E., P.S., County Engineer
Thomas G. Partridge P.E., P.S., Chief Deputy

186 East Satin Street Phone (440) 576-3707 » Fax (440) 576-3719

Jefferson, Ohio 44047-1419 www.ashtabulacounty.us/engineer

March 25, 2022

Board of County Commissioners
25 West Jefferson St.
Jefferson, OH 44047

Re: Accept Bid Quotation #302 Liquid Asphalt Emulsion

Dear Board,

We would like to recommend the bid of Russell Standard Corp., 990 Hazel
Street, Akron, OH 44305 in the amount of $2.16/gallon for CRS-2 and $2.49 for
CMS-2 for Liquid Asphalt Emulsion as submitted. Total of bid for 103,500
gallons of CRS-2 @ $2.16/gallon and 202,500 gallons of CMS-2 @ $2.49/gallon
is $727,785.00.

The only other bidder was Suit-Kote Corporation, 10965 McHenry Street,
Meadville, PA 16335. Since they failed to supply a bid guarantee until after the
bids were received and opened, we are choosing to reject their bid.

The engineer's estimate was $673,000.00.

Thank you for your consideration of this matter.

Sincerely,

' ’)<;;M,,..—»~~"‘"“"""“'"“

Thomas G. Partridge
Chief Deputy Engineer



